
List of reservations to Article 21 (or reference to Art 21) 
 
Australia  
Article 20 "Australia interprets the rights provided for by articles 19, 21 and 22 as consistent 
with article 20; accordingly, the Common wealth and the constituent States, having legislated 
with respect to the subject matter of the article in matters of practical concern in the interest 
of public order ( ordre public ), the right is reserved not to introduce any further legislative 
provision on these matters." 
 
Austria 
Articles 19, 21 and 22 in connection with article 2 (1) of the Covenant will be applied provided 
that they are not in conflict with legal restrictions as provided for in article 16 of the European 
Convention for the Protection of Human Rights and Fundamental Freedoms. 
 
Belgium 
Articles 19, 21 and 22 shall be applied by the Belgian Government in the context of the 
provisions and restrictions set forth or authorized in articles 10 and 11 of the Convention for 
the Protection of Human Rights and Fundamental Freedoms of 4 November 1950, by the said 
Convention. 
 
France 
The Government of the Republic declares that articles 19, 21 and 22 of the Covenant will be 
implemented in accordance with articles 10, 11 and16 of the European Convention for the 
Protection of Human Rights and Fundamental Freedoms of 4 November 1950. 
 
Germany  
Articles 19, 21 and 22 in conjunction with Article 2 (1) of the Covenant shall be applied within 
the scope of Article 16 of the Convention of 4 November 1950 for the Protection of Human 
Rights and Fundamental Freedoms. 
 
Luxembourg 
The Government of Luxembourg declares that it does not consider itself obligated to adopt 
legislation in the field covered by article 20, paragraph 1, and that article 20 as a whole will 
be implemented taking into account the rights to freedom of thought, religion, opinion, 
assembly and association laid down in articles 18, 19 and 20 of the Universal Declaration of 
Human Rights and reaffirmed in articles 18, 19, 21 and 22 of the Covenant." 
 
Malta 
Article 20 - The Government of Malta interprets article 20 consistently with the rights 
conferred by Articles 19 and 21 of the Covenant but reserves the right not to introduce any 
legislation for the purposes of article 20 
 
Monaco 
The Princely Government, recalling that the exercise of the rights and freedoms set forth in 
articles 21 and 22 entails duties and responsibilities, declares that it interprets these articles 
as not prohibiting the application of requirements, conditions, restrictions or penalties which 
are prescribed by law and which are necessary in a democratic society to national security, 



territorial integrity or public safety, the defence of order and the prevenion or crime, the 
protection of health or morals, and the protection of the reputation of others, or in order to 
prevent the disclosure of confidential information or to guarantee the authority and 
impartiality of the judiciary. 
 
Trinidad and Tobago  
The Government of the Republic of Trinidad and Tobago reserves the right to impose lawful 
and or reasonable restrictions with respect to the right of assembly under article 21 of the 
Covenant; 
 
 
[See chapter IV.3.] 


